
      Family Activity Advent Calendar      

 

 

 
 

Pick a tree and decorate it 
 

 
 

Play Christmas carols to 
dance and sing along with 

 

 
Have a clear out of old toys, 
good quality clothes, bags, 

shoes, jewellery etc and 
give to your local charity 

shop 
 

 
 

Read or tell a Christmas 
story 

 

 
Create a table centre piece 

out of natural resources 
you can find – shells, rocks, 
driftwood, pinecones, etc… 

 

 
 

Watch a Christmas movie 
together 

 
Create a special Christmas 

gift or card for someone 
special in your life from 

things you can find around 
the house 

 

 
Invite someone new over to 

share in some Christmas 
cookies or share some 

Christmas cookies with a 
place you frequent 

 

 
Bake and enjoy and or give 

away some Christmas 
cookies or other Christmas 

themed food 

 
 

Go on a family outing to see 
the Christmas lights in your 

area 
 
 

 
Spend a night unplugged 
from technology playing 
games, singing, dancing, 

reading, showcasing, 
acting out a play…. 

 

 
Take some time to be 

thankful for your 
experiences, where you are 

in life, etc.  Express this 
through 

drawing/writing/talking 
 

 
 

Make something to leave for 
Santa Claus 

 

 
 

Make some reindeer food 
 

 
 

Donate to your local food 
bank, or do something else 

to assist others with food 
 

 
Go and visit a local rest 

home and give them some 
homemade Christmas 

cards/sit and listen to their 
stories/tell some of your 

own 
 

 
 

Record a family Christmas 
wish and send it to 

someone 
 

 
 

Create your own wrapping 
paper for gifts or reusable 

bags to place gifts in 

 
Share this activity calendar 

with someone 
 

 
Make Christmas 

ornaments or other 
Christmas decorations 

 
Dress up as a family and 

take funny photos 

 
 

Leave someone a happy 
note 

 

 
 

Say a form of grace before 
eating 

 
 

Wish someone a Merry 
Christmas 


